

ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION										
TABULATION OF BIDS										
County - Grundy										
Location: Grundy County Highway Department										
Date: March 22, 2018										
Time: 10:00 A..M.										
HMA - Group 4										
<u>Felix - Deerfield Drive</u>										
			<u>PT Ferro</u>		<u>D Construction</u>		<u>Gallagher</u>		<u>Austin Tyler</u>	
<u>Section 18-04000-00-GM</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
Lev Bind MM N30	Ton	2753	76.50	\$210,604.50	\$60.00	\$165,180.00	73.90	\$203,446.70	\$75.00	\$206,475.00
HMA Surf Rem Butt Jt	Sq. Yd.	720	0.01	\$7.20	\$0.01	\$7.20	21.50	\$15,480.00	\$20.00	\$14,400.00
Aggregate Shoulders, Type B	Ton	325	40.00	\$13,000.00	\$26.00	\$8,450.00	41.60	\$13,520.00	\$42.00	\$13,650.00
Epoxy Pvt Mk Line 4	Foot	17,450	0.30	\$5,235.00	\$0.33	\$5,758.50	0.30	\$5,235.00	\$0.35	\$6,107.50
Bit Matls Pr Ct	Pounds	11,913	0.01	\$119.13	\$0.01	\$119.13	0.65	\$7,743.45	\$0.01	\$119.13
Short-Term Pavement Marking	Foot	873	0.01	\$8.73	\$1.00	\$873.00	2.70	\$2,357.10	\$3.50	\$3,055.50
Aggregate (Prime Coat)	Ton	53	0.01	\$0.53	\$0.01	\$0.53	0.01	\$0.53	\$0.01	\$0.53
Total				\$228,975.09		\$180,388.36		\$247,782.78		\$243,807.66
<u>Goose Lake - Erickson & Jugtown Roads</u>										
			<u>PT Ferro</u>		<u>D Construction</u>		<u>Gallagher</u>		<u>Austin Tyler</u>	
<u>Section 18-07000-00-GM</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
Lev Bind MM N30	Ton	3652	\$75.00	\$273,900.00	\$60.00	\$219,120.00	68.00	\$248,336.00	73.00	\$266,596.00
HMA Surf Rem Butt Jt	Sq. Yd.	356	\$0.01	\$3.56	\$0.01	\$3.56	26.00	\$9,256.00	24.00	\$8,544.00
Aggregate Shoulders, Type B	Ton	904	\$40.00	\$36,160.00	\$23.00	\$20,792.00	28.00	\$25,312.00	32.00	\$28,928.00
Epoxy Pvt Mk Line 4	Foot	26,682	\$0.30	\$8,004.60	\$0.33	\$8,805.06	0.30	\$8,004.60	0.30	\$8,004.60
Raised Pavement Reflectors	Each	139	\$36.00	\$5,004.00	\$35.20	\$4,892.80	32.15	\$4,468.85	35.00	\$4,865.00
Raised Pavement Reflectors Remova	Each	82	\$0.01	\$0.82	\$7.50	\$615.00	26.00	\$2,132.00	30.00	\$2,460.00
Bit Matls Pr Ct	Pounds	12,449	\$0.01	\$124.49	\$0.01	\$124.49	0.65	\$8,091.85	0.01	\$124.49
Short-Term Pavement Marking	Foot	1,110	\$0.01	\$11.10	\$1.00	\$1,110.00	2.40	\$2,664.00	3.50	\$3,885.00
Aggregate (Prime Coat)	Ton	55	\$0.01	\$0.55	\$0.01	\$0.55	0.01	\$0.55	0.01	\$0.55
Total				\$323,209.12		\$255,463.46		\$308,265.85		\$323,407.64
<u>Saratoga - Ridgcrest Subdivison Streets</u>										
			<u>PT Ferro</u>		<u>D Construction</u>		<u>Gallagher</u>		<u>Austin Tyler</u>	
<u>Section 18-15000-00-GM, Non-MFT</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
Level Binder MM N30	Ton	1,849	\$65.50	\$121,109.50	\$61.50	\$113,713.50	\$72.00	\$133,128.00	\$70.00	\$129,430.00
HMA Surface Removal - Butt JT	Sq. Yd.	427	\$0.01	\$4.27	\$0.01	\$4.27	\$10.00	\$4,270.00	\$8.00	\$3,416.00
Pavement Remoival - Surface Milling	Lbs.	7,100	\$2.00	\$14,200.00	\$1.40	\$9,940.00	\$1.70	\$12,070.00	\$2.50	\$17,750.00
Bituminous Materials (PC)	Lbs.	7,428	\$0.01	\$74.28	\$0.01	\$74.28	\$0.70	\$5,199.60	\$0.01	\$74.28
Aggregate (Prime Coat)	Ton	33	\$0.01	\$0.33	\$0.01	\$0.33	\$0.01	\$0.33	\$0.01	\$0.33
Total				\$135,388.38		\$123,732.38		\$154,667.93		\$150,670.61
<u>Wauponsee - Southard Road</u>										
			<u>PT Ferro</u>		<u>D Construction</u>		<u>Gallagher</u>		<u>Austin Tyler</u>	
<u>Section 18-17000-00-GM</u>	<u>Unit</u>	<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Total</u>
Lev Bind MM N30	Ton	819	\$73.50	\$60,196.50	\$61.00	\$49,959.00	\$79.00	\$64,701.00	No Bid	#VALUE!
HMA Surf Rem Butt Jt	Sq. Yd.	228	\$0.01	\$2.28	\$0.01	\$2.28	\$26.00	\$5,928.00	No Bid	#VALUE!
Aggregate Shoulders, Type B	Ton	224	\$30.00	\$6,720.00	\$24.00	\$5,376.00	\$50.00	\$11,200.00	No Bid	#VALUE!
Bit Matls Pr Ct	Pounds	2,858	\$0.01	\$28.58	\$0.01	\$28.58	\$0.70	\$2,000.60	No Bid	#VALUE!
Agg Pr Ct	Ton	12	\$0.01	\$0.12	\$0.01	\$0.12	\$0.01	\$0.12	No Bid	#VALUE!
Total				\$66,947.48		\$55,365.98		\$83,829.72		#VALUE!